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Windsor 9.840-380-0 CHARIOT EXTRACT stand up carpet 

cleaner.  Include 3-12 volt batteries and automatic charger $10,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,922.22

NOBLES 9004133 speed scrub 32” DISH walk behind 

scrubber with H20 technology.  22.5 gallon solution tank, 27 

gallon recovery tank.  Includes pad drivers, 4-6 volt batteries 

and on board charger. $9,277.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,698.00 $11,817.34 $10,316.31 no bid

CLARKE BOOST 05371A 28x14 walk behind automatic 

scrubber.  20 gallon solution and recovery tanks.  Includes 

pad drivers, batteries, and on board charger. $7,735.00 No Bid No Bid $7,740.09 No Bid $8,041.91 No Bid $10,461.64 No Bid $8,085.77 No Bid no bid

CLARKE 997002 28x14 white pads $58.00 No Bid No Bid $26.95 No Bid $35.28 No Bid $51.57 $57.00 $29.88 No Bid no bid

CLARKE 997001 28x14 red pads $58.00 No Bid No Bid $27.61 No Bid $36.02 No Bid $52.84 $57.00 $34.97 No Bid no bid

CLARKE 997006 28x14 blue pads $58.00 No Bid No Bid $27.61 No Bid $36.02 No Bid $52.84 $57.00 $30.60 No Bid no bid

CLARKE 997000 28x14 black pads $59.50 No Bid No Bid $31.56 No Bid $40.46 No Bid $60.38 $58.70 $30.60 No Bid no bid

CLARKE 997018 Maroon pads $124.50 No Bid No Bid $170.94 No Bid $197.04 No Bid $327.05 No Bid $189.43 No Bid no bid

CLARKE 30794A 28x14 velcro $78.00 No Bid No Bid $55.94 No Bid $58.18 No Bid $98.12 No Bid $61.99 No Bid no bid

NOBLES 9007629 EX SPOT carpet spotter pkg.  Includes 2 

gallon extractor, hand tool, hoses and cart $645.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $454.12 No Bid No Bid $604.00 $821.31 $398.72 no bid

NOBLES 605976 EX SPOT wand attachment with floor 

tool and 10 foot vac hose $295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $290.00 $351.96 $287.83 no bid

PRO 106573 PROTEAM super coach back pack vac with 

HEPA filtration and standard attachments $369.00 $330.27 No Bid $334.02 No Bid $358.85 No Bid No Bid $367.00 $629.00 $345.88 $434.38

WINDSOR 9.840-811.0 CHARIOT I SCRUB 20” stand up 

automatic scrubber.  Includes pad driver, 3-12 volt batteries 

and on board charger. $5,125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $13,339.54 $4,834.94

CLARKE 56380773 TFC Touch Free Cleaner.  20 gallon 

water tank.  Includes 25 foot vacuum and solution hoses, 400 

PSI spray gun, wand, scrub brush and caddy $2,719.00 No Bid No Bid $2,437.91 No Bid $2,694.77 No Bid $3,671.70 No Bid $2,707.83 $1,800.00 no bid

CLARKE 56380871 front mount squeegee hardware $190.00 No Bid No Bid $161.02 No Bid $180.90 No Bid $282.40 No Bid $178.44 No Bid no bid

CLARKE 56209088 24” front mount squeegee $98.00 No Bid No Bid $82.84 No Bid $101.48 No Bid $145.29 No Bid $91.80 No Bid no bid

WINDSOR 9.840-710.0 Saber Blade 16” cylind. micro 

scrubber $2,540.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,861.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $2,305.83 $2,399.71

RUB 2643 blue 44 gallon BRUTE container $42.50 $33.24 $49.95 $40.64 $48.73 $40.00 $27.45 $37.99 $37.40 $45.95 $41.46 $37.78

RUB 2620 blue 20 gallon BRUTE container $21.40 $16.68 $29.95 $19.24 $23.60 $20.12 $15.03 $19.11 $18.80 $23.23 $20.85 $19.00
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RUB 2640 BRUTE DOLLY for 2643 and 2620 BRUTE 

containers $43.00 $23.94 $43.95 $33.00 $42.66 $40.59 $24.00 $38.44 $36.30 $46.66 $40.27 $38.23

RUB 4611 spring platform truck 14 cubic feet $435.00 $417.60 $429.95 $416.00 $899.99 $409.41 $580.50 $388.83 $382.50 $473.32 $424.39 $386.67

RUB 1011 structural foam tilt truck .75 cubic yard $499.00 $478.80 $489.95 $462.62 $766.10 $469.41 $598.60 $445.82 $438.50 $487.99 $486.59 $443.34

RUB 7677 WAVEBREAK 35 quart dual water mopping 

down press combo.  Includes dirty water bucket and quiet 

caster dolly $133.00 $133.20 $139.95 $119.80 $139.66 $130.59 $166.50 $124.03 $122.00 $135.82 $135.37 $123.34

Total Bid $41,597.90 $1,433.73 $2,626.15 $14,629.18 $15,206.65 $2,366.56 $18,047.89 $14,560.80 $26,273.89 $32,900.51 $22,083.42


